
                                     CITY OF OWOSSO BID TABULATION SHEET DATE 4/12/2022
DEPT. DPW

SUBJECT:

Optional 
Renewal

Optional 
Renewal

ITEM # DESCRIPTION 2023/2024 2024-2025
1 Handicap - Bennett Field 1 168.00$      1,554.00$          No Bid No Bid -$                         

Empty once per week

2 Regular - Collamer Park 1 128.00$      1,184.00$          No Bid No Bid 
Empty once per week

3 Handicap - Collamer Park 1 168.00$      1,554.00$          No Bid No Bid 
Empty once per week

4 Handicap - Location TBD 1 168.00$      1,554.00$          No Bid No Bid 
Empty once per week

5 Handicap - Bentley Park 1 336.00$      3,108.00$          No Bid No Bid 
Empty twice weekly on Friday & Monday

6 Regular-Harmon Patridge Park 1 256.00$      2,368.00$          No Bid No Bid 
Empty twice weekly on Friday & Monday

7 Handicap-Harmon Patridge Park 1 336.00$      3,108.00$          No Bid No Bid 
Empty twice weekly on  Friday & Monday

8 Note: on 4 week schedule, 37 weeks 
of service.

Total: 14,430.00$        -$                  -$              
TOTAL BID PRICING ADJUSTED FOR LOCAL PURCHASING PREFERENCE:$2,500

DEPT
HEAD AWARDED:

PURCH. WORKERS COMPENSATION INSURANCE COUNCIL
AGENT: EXPIRATION DATE: APPROVED:

STAFF SOLE PROPRIETORSHIP 
REC.: EXPIRATION DATE: N/A PO NUMBER:

2022 Portable Toilets  
Two 1-year renewable options

GENERAL LIABILITY INSURANCE
EXPIRATION DATE:

2022/2023  8 
MonthsMonthly 

RateQTY

Sloans Septic Tank Service
16101 W Brady Rd., Oakley, MI  48649

989-845-6280
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