CITY OF OWOSSO BID TABULATION SHEET

DATE 5/31/2016 DEPT. WATER

ITEM # DESCRIPTION EST. QTY UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT PRICE TOTAL 1 FERRIC CHLORIDE 72.000 LBS \$ 0.598 \$ 43.056.00 \$ 0.610 \$ 43.320.00 NO BID \$ 1 FERRIC CHLORIDE 72.000 LBS \$ 0.598 \$ 43.056.00 \$ 0.610 \$ 43.320.00 NO BID \$ 1 FERRIC CHLORIDE I			-		KEMIRA WA		PVS TECHNOLOGIES INC		UNIVAR USA INC	
NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID S 43,056.00 S 43,920.00 S TOTAL BID S 43,056.00 S 43,920.00 S S S S S S S S S S S S S S S S S S	ITEM #	DESCRIPTION		UNIT		TOTAL		TOTAL		TOTAL
OTAL BID PRICING ADJUSTED FOR LOCAL PURCHASING PREFERENCE: PT. GENERAL LIABILITY INSURANCE AWARDED: AWARDED: IRCH. WORKERS COMPENSATION INSURANCE COUNCIL	1	FERRIC CHLORIDE	72,000	LBS	\$ 0.598	\$ 43,056.00	\$ 0.610	\$ 43,920.00	NO BID	\$
	PT. AD:	D PRICING ADJUSTED FOR LOCAL PU	- -	REFERENCE: GENERAL LIABI EXPIRATION DA	TE:	E		AWARDED:		\$
SOLE PROPRIETORSHIP	ENT:		-							